From: Tumbler Ridge Search and Rescue
<tumblerridgesar@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2020 4:35 PM

To: Jill Rickert

Cc: PRRD_Internal

Subject: Re: FW: PRRD Allocation TRSAR F550 Insurance

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization.

We could certainly reduce that to half it’s original ask, yes.

Thanks for checking!

On Tue, Jul 14, 2020 at 3:12 PM Jill Rickert <Jill.Rickert@prrd.bc.ca> wrote:

Hi Steve;

I have been asked to clarify whether the amount you wish to carry forward from 2019 is still
$7,201. 67 given the new BCSARA fleet rates you are able to utilize. I’m wondering if perhaps
you won’t need the full amount based on your reduction in the insurance requested for the 2020
application.

Thank you,
Jill Rickert | Grant Coordinator

Direct: 250-784-3209 | jill.rickert@prrd.bc.ca

PEACE RIVER REGIONAL DISTRICT | Box 810, 1981 Alaska Highway Avenue, Dawson Creek, BC

V1G 4H8
Toll Free: (24 hrs): 1-800-670-7773 | Office: 250-784-3200 | Fax: 250-784-3201 | www.prrd.bc.ca
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I have been asked to clarify whether the amount you wish to carry forward from 2019 is still

$7,201. 67 given the new BCSARA fleet rates you are able to utilize. I’m wondering if perhaps

you won’t need the full amount based on your reduction in the insurance requested for the 2020
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From: tumblerridgesar@gmail.com <tumblerridgesar@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 9:34 PM

To: Jill Rickert <Jill.Rickert@prrd.bc.ca>

Cc: PRRD _Internal <prrd.internal@prrd.bc.ca>

Subject: RE: PRRD Allocation TRSAR F550 Insurance

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization.

Thanks for your attention to this matter Jill and for explaining the timing problem.

I’d also like to request that 2020 request be reduced from $7000 to $3500 for the Truck
insurance item. We’re very pleased that our provincial governing body, BCSARA, has a new
fleet program that | expect should reduce our costs on this going forward.

Thanks again,

Steve Tory

President

Tumbler Ridge Search and Rescue
250-242-7195

From: Jill Rickert <Jill.Rickert@prrd.bc.ca>

Sent: July 13, 2020 2:17 PM

To: 'tumblerridgesar@gmail.com' <tumblerridgesar@gmail.com>
Cc: PRRD_Internal <prrd.internal@prrd.bc.ca>

Subject: RE: PRRD Allocation TRSAR F550 Insurance

Hi Steve;
Thanks for taking the time to discuss the TR SAR application.
As you know the SAR grant policy states that grant funds cannot be carried forward and must

be used within 1 year of approval, so to grant an exception for the 2019 grant allocation, the
request must first go to the Emergency Executive Committee and from there to the Regional




Board. Essentially, what is being asked is to waive this portion of the policy and only the
Regional Board can do that.

As you have indicated that if the exception was granted, then TR SAR would not need to be
considered for a 2020 grant; however, was granted the exception, then it’s likely they wouldn’t
need a 2020 grant allocation. The tricky part about all of this is the timing. The request to make
the exception and allow TR SAR to carry forward the 2019 allocation goes first to the
Emergency Executive Committee and from there is recommended to the Board.

The unfortunate part is the timing of meetings and the approval of the 2020 grant allocations.
It’s unlikely that the request for an exception will be processed prior to the 2020 SAR grant
approvals, but I will move it forward for the Emergency Executive Committee for the upcoming
July 23" meeting and wait to proceed based on their discussion. | will advise you of the
outcomes as soon as | know.

Thank you,
Jill Rickert | Grant Coordinator

Direct: 250-784-3209 | jill.rickert@prrd.bc.ca

PEACE RIVER REGIONAL DISTRICT | Box 810, 1981 Alaska Highway Avenue, Dawson Creek, BC
V1G 4H8
Toll Free: (24 hrs): 1-800-670-7773 | Office: 250-784-3200 | Fax: 250-784-3201 | www.prrd.bc.ca

IMPORTANT: The information transmitted herein is confidential and may contain privileged or personal information. It is intended solely for
the person or entity to which it is addressed. Any review, re-transmission, dissemination, taking of any action in reliance upon, or other use of
this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error, please notify the sender and
delete or destroy all digital and printed copies.

From: tumblerridgesar@gmail.com <tumblerridgesar@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, May 29, 2020 12:34 PM

To: Dale Bumstead <mayorbumstead@dawsoncreek.ca>

Cc: Jill Rickert <Jill.Rickert@prrd.bc.ca>

Subject: PRRD Allocation TRSAR F550 Insurance




Dale & Jill,

I’m preparing our grant request and wanted to ensure you were aware that we weren’t able to
claim most of our group’s allocation (ICBC insurance for our new command truck) due to
COVID delays beyond our control with the assembly of that truck. We were expecting to insure
it this summer but it’s now looking like late Fall or Winter which puts us beyond the expense
deadline of Sept 5, 2020.

I’ve spoken on this matter with Brian Lamond and we both hope an exception can be made and
these funds can be carried forward. If that’s the case we wouldn’t need to claim this in the 20/21
allocation and could see those funds go to other uses.

Thanks for all you do,

Steve Tory

President

Tumbler Ridge Search and Rescue
250-242-7195

Steve Tory

President

Tumbler Ridge Search and Rescue
250-242-7195
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